

**REGISTER – Conflicts of Interest - Councillor**

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 9 February 2015 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	James Dooley (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.3: 2015 National General Assembly of Local Government – 14 to 17 June 2015 – Canberra.  Attending the conference.	Interest	Council Meeting OM267 – 9 February 2015  Item 11.3	Yes, Cr Dooley left the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Council Minutes on Website)	Refer Council Minutes (A1845338)
Monday 9 February 2015 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Darrel Taylor (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.3: 2015 National General Assembly of Local Government – 14 to 17 June 2015 – Canberra.  Attending the conference.	Interest	Council Meeting OM267 – 9 February 2015  Item 11.3	Yes, Cr Dooley left the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Council Minutes on Website)	Refer Council Minutes (A1845338)
Monday 9 February 2015 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Sandra Mayer (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.3: 2015 National General Assembly of Local Government – 14 to 17 June 2015 – Canberra.  Attending the conference.	Interest	Council Meeting OM267 – 9 February 2015  Item 11.3	Yes, Cr Dooley left the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Council Minutes on Website)	Refer Council Minutes (A1845338)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 2 March 2015 (via email to the Chief Executive Officer)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Declaration of interest made in writing to the Chief Executive Officer classifying the type of interest and nature of the interest in accordance s79 of the <i>Local Government Act</i> 1989.	Direct Interest	Council Meeting OM271 – 2 March 2015 Item 10.1	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Minutes on Council Website)	*emailed directly to CEO* (A1863890)
Monday 13 April 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item C2: Award of Contract No 2014/15-70 Golf Links Road Reconstruction.  Lives along Golf Links Road.	Interest	Council Meeting OM270 – 13 April 2015 Item C2	Yes, Cr Hampton left the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Minutes on Council Website)	Refer Council Minutes (A1887298)
Monday 4 May 2015 at 6.25pm (via email to the Chief Executive Officer)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Declaration of interest made in writing to the Chief Executive Officer classifying the type of interest and nature of the interest in accordance s79 of the <i>Local Government Act</i> 1989.	Direct Interest	Council Meeting OM271 – 4 May 2015 Item 10.1	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Minutes on Council Website)	A1897451 (Email from Councillor) A1905602 (Minutes)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 25 May 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Suzette Tayler (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item C1: Purchase of rear of 33 Bruarong Crescent, Frankston.  Knows the owners.	Indirect Interest by Closed Association	Council Meeting OM272 – 25 May 2015 Item C1	Yes, Cr Tayler left the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Minutes on Council Website)	Refer to Council Minutes (A1907043)
Monday 25 May 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	James Dooley (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.16: Frankston Metropolitan Activity Centre Structure Plan.  Interest in common – did not vote on the matter.	Interest in common	Council Meeting OM272 – 25 May 2015 Item 11.16	No, Cr Dooley remained in the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Minutes on Council Website)	Refer to Council Minutes (A1907043)
Monday 5 October 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Darrel Taylor (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.15: NOM 1167 – Kingsley Park Primary School Sporting Equipment Packs.  His daughters attend the primary school.	Indirect Interest by Close Association	Council Meeting OM278 – 5 October 2015 Item 12.15	Yes, Cr Taylor left the chamber while discussions on the matter took place. (Refer to Minutes on Council Website)	Refer to Council Minutes (A1997053)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 26 October 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Glenn Aitken (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.5: Mechanics Institute – Frankston Symphony Orchestra.  Brother and sister in law are involved in the Frankston Symphony Orchestra.	Interest	Council Meeting OM279 – 26 October 2015 Item 12.5	No, the Councillor remained in the Chamber while discussion on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3012119)
Monday 26 October 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Sandra Mayer (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 13.4: NOM 1177 – Bully Zero Australia Foundation – Bull Zero Sessions for Elizabeth Murdoch Secondary College, Langwarrin and Carrum Downs Secondary College, Carrum Downs	Interest	Council Meeting OM279 – 26 October 2015 Item 13.4	No, the Councillor remained in the Chamber while discussion on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3012119)
Monday 7 December 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	James Dooley (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.1: Planning Application No 468/2013/P – 571 Nepean Highway, Frankston – to construct one (1) dwelling in a Design and Development Overlay (Schedule 6) and associated works within an Erosion Management Overlay. One of the speakers is well known to them.	Interest	Council Meeting OM281 – 7 December 2015 Item 11.1	No, the Councillor remained in the Chamber while discussion on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3032908)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 7 December 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	<p>Interest in Item 11.1: Planning Application No 468/2013/P – 571 Nepean Highway, Frankston – to construct one (1) dwelling in a Design and Development Overlay (Schedule 6) and associated works within an Erosion Management Overlay.</p> <p>One of the speakers is well known to them.</p>	Interest	Council Meeting OM281 – 7 December 2015 Item 11.1	No, the Councillor remained in the Chamber while discussion on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3032908)
Monday 7 December 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Glenn Aitken (Councillor)	Not applicable	<p>Interest in Item 11.1: Planning Application No 468/2013/P – 571 Nepean Highway, Frankston – to construct one (1) dwelling in a Design and Development Overlay (Schedule 6) and associated works within an Erosion Management Overlay.</p> <p>One of the speakers is well known to them.</p>	Interest	Council Meeting OM281 – 7 December 2015 Item 11.1	No, the Councillor remained in the Chamber while discussion on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3032908)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 7 December 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.1: Planning Application No 468/2013/P – 571 Nepean Highway, Frankston – to construct one (1) dwelling in a Design and Development Overlay (Schedule 6) and associated works within an Erosion Management Overlay.  One of the speakers is well known to them.	Interest	Council Meeting OM281 – 7 December 2015  Item 11.1	No, the Councillor remained in the Chamber while discussion on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3032908)
Monday 7 December 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.9: Adoption of Paths Development Plan  One of the paths identified in the plan is in his street of residence	Interest in common	Council Meeting OM281 – 7 December 2015  Item 12.9	No, the Councillor remained in the Chamber while discussion on the matter took place	Refer to Council Minutes (A3032908)
Monday 7 December 2015 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Darrel Taylor (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in item C1: Issuing Small Business Grants  One of the recipients provides supplies to his workplace.	Interest	Council Meeting OM281 – 7 December 2015  Item C1	No, the Councillor remained in the Chamber while discussion on the matter took place	Refer to Council Minutes (A3032908)

<b>Date and Time of Declaration</b>	<b>Name (including Position / Title)</b>	<b>Department and Directorate (if applicable)</b>	<b>Nature of Interest</b>	<b>Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.</b>	<b>Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)</b>	<b>After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?</b>	<b>EDMS ID:</b>
Monday 1 February 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	James Dooley (Mayor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.3: National General Assembly of Local Government from 19 to 22 June 2016	Interest	Council Meeting OM282 – 1 February 2016 Item 12.3	No, the Mayor remained in the chamber while discussions on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3064061)
Monday 1 February 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Sandra Mayer (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.3: National General Assembly of Local Government from 19 to 22 June 2016	Interest	Council Meeting OM282 – 1 February 2016 Item 12.3	No, Cr Mayer remained in the chamber while discussions on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3064061)
Monday 1 February 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.3: National General Assembly of Local Government from 19 to 22 June 2016	Interest	Council Meeting OM282 – 1 February 2016 Item 12.3	No, Cr Hampton remained in the chamber while discussions on the matter took place.	Refer to Council Minutes (A3064061)
Monday 16 May 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.1: Planning Application 618/2015/P – 45 Foot Street, Frankston – to extend the hours of trading under a Packaged Liquor Licence	Interest in common	Council Meeting OM287 – 16 May 2016 Item 11.1	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber while discussions took place.	A3137739

<b>Date and Time of Declaration</b>	<b>Name (including Position / Title)</b>	<b>Department and Directorate (if applicable)</b>	<b>Nature of Interest</b>	<b>Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.</b>	<b>Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)</b>	<b>After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?</b>	<b>EDMS ID:</b>
Monday 27 June 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Darrel Taylor (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item C2: Councillor Conduct Panel	Interest	Council Meeting OM289 – 27 June 2016 Item C2	Yes, Cr Taylor left the chamber while discussions took place	A3157266 (Confidential Minutes)
Monday 27 June 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item C2: Councillor Conduct Panel	Interest	Council Meeting OM289 – 27 June 2016 Item C2	No, Cr Hampton remained in the chamber while discussions took place	A3157266 (Confidential Minutes)
Monday 18 July 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Suzette Tayler (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.7 – Results of Beckwith Grove Bridge Replacement Consultation	Interest in common	Council Meeting OM290 – 18 July 2016 Item 12.7	No, Cr Tayler remained in the chamber while discussions and voting took place	A3172314
Monday 18 July 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.5 – Update on Various Special Charge Scheme Projects	Interest in common	Council Meeting OM290 – 18 July 2016 Item 12.5	No, Cr Cunial remained in the chamber while discussions and voting took place	A3172314



Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 18 July 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.6 – Information on Councils Current and Planned Local Area Traffic Management (LATM) Investigation and Implementation	Interest in common	Council Meeting OM290 – 18 July 2016 Item 12.6	No, Cr Cunial remained in the chamber while discussions and voting took place	A3172314
Monday 8 August 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Suzette Tayler (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.3 – Response to Petition – Beckwith Grove Pedestrian Bridge	Interest in common	Council Meeting OM291 – 8 August 2016 Item 12.3	No, Cr Tayler remained in the chamber while discussions and voting took place.	A3184806
Monday 29 August 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Michael O'Reilly (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.1 – Response to residents Joint Letter requesting traffic treatments along Galway Street, Seaford	Direct Interest	Council Meeting OM292 – 29 August 2016 Item 12.1	Yes, Cr O'Reilly left the chamber while discussions and voting took place.	A3199276
Monday 29 August 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.2 – Planning Application 733/2015/P to construct one (1) triple storey dwelling – 28 Gould Street, Frankston	Interest – family member has a close relationship with Architect	Council Meeting OM292 – 29 August 2016 Item 11.2	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber while discussions and voting took place.	A3199276

<b>Date and Time of Declaration</b>	<b>Name (including Position / Title)</b>	<b>Department and Directorate (if applicable)</b>	<b>Nature of Interest</b>	<b>Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.</b>	<b>Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)</b>	<b>After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?</b>	<b>EDMS ID:</b>
Monday 28 November 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.6 – September Town Planning Progress Report	Indirect interest by residential amenity	Council Meeting OM294 – 28 November 2016 Item 11.6	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber while discussions and voting took place.	A3264599
Monday 28 November 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Kristopher Bolam (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item C2 – Proposed recipient for Citizen, Young Citizen, Senior Citizen and Community Event of the Year Awards for 2017	Interest	Council Meeting OM294 – 28 November 2016 Item C2	No, Cr Cunial left the chamber while discussions and voting took place.	A3336352 (Confidential Minutes)
Monday 19 December 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 12.11 – Centenary Park Sporting Complex	Interest in Common	Council Meeting OM295 – 19 December 2016 Item 12.11	Yes, Cr Hampton remained in the chamber for discussions and voting	A3272663
Monday 19 December 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in NOM 1241 – Centenary Park Golf Course Committee	Interest in Common	Council Meeting OM295 – 19 December 2016: Item 13.2	Yes, Cr Hampton remained in the chamber for discussions and voting	A3272663

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 19 December 2016 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Kristopher Bolam (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item C1 – Proposed recipient for Citizen, Young Citizen, Senior Citizen and Community Event of the Year Awards for 2017	Interest	Council Meeting OM295 – 19 December 2016  Item C1	No, Cr Bolam left the chamber while discussions and voting took place.	A3272644 (Confidential Minutes)
Monday 30 January 2017 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Quinn McCormack (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 13.14 NOM 1271 – Access to Frankston Nature Reserve Sweetwater Creek	Indirect Interest by Conflicting Duty	Council Meeting OM296 – 30 January 2017  Item 13.14	Yes, Cr McCormack left the chamber while discussions and voting took place.	A3302170
Monday 14 March 2017 (disclosure made via email to the CEO on 14 March 2017 and disclosed during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.1 Planning Application 556/2016/P – 223 Beach Street, Frankston – to use the land to sell liquor (NQR Beach Street).  <i>Note: this item was deferred to the 3<sup>rd</sup> April Council Meeting – refer to Minutes</i>	Indirect Financial Interest	Council Meeting OM298 – 14 March 2017  Item 11.1	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber during discussions and voting.	A3336378 (Minutes)  A3317438 (Email from Councillor)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 3 April 2017 (disclosure made via email to the CEO on 14 March 2017 and disclosed during Council meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Interest in Item 11.4 Planning Application 556/2016/P – 223 Beach Street, Frankston – to use the land to sell liquor (NQR Beach Street).	Indirect Financial Interest	Council Meeting OM299 – 3 April 2017  Item 11.4	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber during discussions and voting.	A3349316 (Minutes)  A3317438 (Email from Councillor)
Monday 3 April 2017 (disclosure made during Council meeting)	Steve Toms (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.2: 2017 National General Assembly of Local Government from 18 to 21 June 2017 - Canberra ACT	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM299 – 3 April 2017  Item 12.2	Yes, Cr Toms left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3349316 (Minutes)
Monday 1 May 2017 (disclosure made via email to the CEO on 24 <sup>th</sup> April 2017 and disclosed during the Council meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 11.7: January Town Planning Report.	Indirect Financial Interest	Council Meeting OM300 – 1 May 2017  Item 11.7	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber during the discussions and voting	A3341545 (Email from Councillor)  A3349310 (Minutes)
Monday 1 May 2017 (disclosure made during Council meeting)	Kris Bolam (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C.2: Frankston Charitable Fund Grants.	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM300 – 1 May 2017  Item C2	Yes, Cr Bolam left the chamber during the discussions and voting	A3349310 (Minutes)  <i>Declaration made verbally to CEO</i>

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 22 May 2017 (disclosure made during Council meeting)	Quinn McCormack (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 13.6: NOM 1317 - Frankston Nature Conservation Reserve	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM301 – 22 May 2017  Item 13.6	Yes, Cr McCormack left the chamber during the discussions and voting	A3365680 (Minutes)  <i>Declaration made verbally to CEO</i>
Monday 22 May 2017 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 11.3: February Town Planning Progress Report	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM301 – 22 May 2017  Item 11.3	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3365680 (Minutes)  A3397116 (Email)
Monday 22 May 2017 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.17: Response to NOM 1265 - Cleanliness of the City	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM301 – 22 May 2017  Item 12.17	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3365680 (Minutes)  <i>Declaration made verbally to CEO and Director</i>
Monday 3 <sup>rd</sup> July 2017 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Quinn McCormack (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 11.7: Town Planning Application 505/2016/P - 67 Lawson Avenue, Frankston South 3199 - To construct two (2) double storey dwellings	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM303 – 3 July 2017  Item 11.7	Yes, Cr McCormack left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3394345 (Minutes)  <i>Declaration made verbally to CEO</i>

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 4 <sup>th</sup> September 2017 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Steve Toms (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C2: Request to fund a Councillor's legal fees	Direct Interest	Council Meeting OM306 – 4 September 2017  Item C2	Yes, Cr Toms left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3455288 (Open Minutes)  A3455290 (Confidential Minutes)
Monday 25 <sup>th</sup> September 2017 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Kris Bolam (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.11: Councillor Training	Direct Interest	Council Meeting OM307 – 25 September 2017  Item 12.11	Yes, Cr Bolam left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3455283 (Minutes)  <i>Declaration made verbally to the CEO</i>
Monday 25 <sup>th</sup> September 2017 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Quinn McCormack (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.11: Councillor Training	Direct Interest	Council Meeting OM307 – 25 September 2017  Item 12.11	Yes, Cr McCormack left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3455283 (Minutes)  <i>Declaration made verbally to the CEO</i>
Monday 16 <sup>th</sup> October 2017 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Quinn McCormack (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.14: Councillor Training	Direct Interest	Council Meeting OM308 – 16 October 2017  Item 12.14	Yes, Cr McCormack left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3469608 (Minutes)  <i>Declaration made verbally to the CEO</i>

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 16 <sup>th</sup> October 2017 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Kris Bolam (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.14: Councillor Training	Direct Interest	Council Meeting OM308 – 16 October 2017  Item 12.14	Yes, Cr Bolam left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3469608 (Minutes)  <i>Declaration made verbally to the CEO</i>
Monday 11 December 2017 (disclosure made via email to the CEO)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Declaration of interest made in writing to the Chief Executive Officer classifying the type of interest and nature of the interest in accordance s79 of the <i>Local Government Act 1989</i> .	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM310 – 11 December 2017  Item C1	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3667888 (Minutes)
Monday 11 December 2017 (disclosure made during the Council meeting)	Glenn Aitken (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C1: Proposed Recipients for Citizen, Young Citizen, Senior Citizen and Community Event of the Year Awards 2018	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM310 – 11 December 2017  Item C1	Yes, Cr Aitken left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3667888 (Minutes)
Monday 11 December 2017 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C1: Proposed Recipients for Citizen, Young Citizen, Senior Citizen and Community Event of the Year Awards 2018	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting OM310 – 11 December 2017  Item C1	Yes, Cr Hampton left the chamber during discussions and voting	A3667888 (Minutes)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 15 January 2019 (disclosure made during Councillor Briefing session)	Sandra Mayer (Councillor)	Not applicable	Home and Community Care item on the Councillor Briefing Agenda dated 15 January 2019  <i>Works for a provider and will leave the room during discussion</i>	Interest	Councillor Briefing Item – Home and Community Care	Yes, Cr Mayer left the chamber during discussions	A3536846 (Record of Assembly of Councillors Form dated 15 January 2019)
Monday 29 January 2018 (disclosure made during the Council meeting)	Kris Bolam (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.7: Mid-Year Budget Review  <i>Former member of Life Gate Inc.</i>	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting 2018/OM1 – 29 January 2018  Item 12.7	No, Cr Bolam remained in the Chamber for discussion and voting	A3541338 (Minutes)
Monday 29 January 2018 (disclosure made during the Council meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C6: Peninsula Leisure Pty Ltd Company Matters  <i>Councillor representative on the Board of PARC</i>	Direct Interest	Council Meeting 2018/OM1 – 29 January 2018  Item C6	Yes, Cr Hampton left the Chamber during discussion and voting	A3541336 (Minutes)
Monday 26 February 2018	Sandra Mayer (Councillor)	Not applicable	HACC Review – Councillor Briefing Item  <i>Cr Mayer works for a provider</i>	Direct Interest	Councillor Briefing dated 26 February 2019 – HACC Review matter	Yes, Cr Mayer left the room at 7.45pm during discussions	A3593090 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form dated 26 February 2018)



Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 26 March 2018 (disclosure made during Councillor Briefing)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Draft Agenda Review – Councillor Briefing item  <i>Cr Hampton declared an interest in Item 12.4 as he would be attending.</i>	Direct Interest	Councillor Briefing dated 26 March 2018	Yes, Cr Hampton left the room during discussions	A3593546 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form dated 26 March 2018)
Monday 3 April 2018 (disclosure made during the Council meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.3: Outbound Delegation to Sister City – Susono, Japan  <i>Mayor is representing Council at the event</i>	Direct Interest	Council Meeting 2018/OM4 – 3 April 2018  Item 12.3	Yes, Cr Hampton left the Chamber during discussion and voting	A3591678 (Minutes)
Tuesday 17 April 2018 (disclosure made during Councillor Briefing)	Sandra Mayer (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C.7: Home and Community Care (HACC) Review  <i>Employed by a provider</i>	Direct Interest	Councillor Briefing dated 17 April 2018 – Draft Council Meeting Agenda Review	Yes, Cr Mayer left the Chamber during discussion	A3593556 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form)
Monday 23 April 2018 (disclosure made during the Council meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C6: Centenary Park Golf Course Expression of Interest  <i>Temporary board member of Peninsula Leisure</i>	Interest	Council Meeting 2018/OM5 – 23 April 2018  Item C6	No, Cr Cunial remained in the Chamber during discussion and voting	A3608923 (Minutes)  A3653762 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 23 April 2018 (disclosure made during the Council meeting)	Sandra Mayer (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C.7: Home and Community Care (HACC) Review  <i>Employed by a provider</i>	Direct Interest	Council Meeting 2018/OM5 – 23 April 2018	Yes, Cr Mayer left the Chamber during discussion and voting	A3608923 (Minutes)  A3653762 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form)
Monday 23 April 2018 (disclosure made during the Council meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 12.5: Outbound Delegation to Sister City - Susono, Japan	Interest	Council Meeting 2018/OM5 – 23 April 2018	No, Cr Hampton remained in the Chamber during discussion and voting	A3608923 (Minutes)  A3653762 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form)
Monday 14 May 2018 (disclosure made during the Council meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item 11.2: Frankston Planning Scheme Amendment C111 – Report on findings and recommendations of Panel Report	Direct Interest	Council Meeting 2018/OM6 – 14 May 2018	No, Cr Mayer left the Chamber during discussion and voting	A3266363 (Minutes)
Monday 16 July 2018 (disclosure made during Councillor Briefing)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	Draft Agenda Review as listed on the Councillor Briefing Agenda.  Cr Cunial noted that he was Council's representative on the Peninsula Leisure Board and noted the items related to Peninsula Leisure on the Agenda.	Interest	Councillor Briefing dated 16 July 2018	No, Cr Cunial remained in the room during the discussions	A3707388 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 23 July 2018 (disclosures made during the Council meeting)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)	Not applicable	<p>Cr Cunial is Council's ex officio representative on the PARC board:</p> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> <li>• Item 14.2: 2018/NOM46 – Peninsula Leisure Pty Ltd Matters;</li> <li>• Item C.3: Frankston Skate Park Management Tender; and</li> <li>• Item C.5: Peninsula Leisure Pty Ltd – Company Matters</li> </ul>	Interest	Council Meeting 2018/OM9 – 23 July 2018	No, Cr Cunial remained in the chamber for discussion and voting	A3681450 (Minutes)
Monday 12 November 2018 (disclosure made during Councillor Briefing)	Kris Bolam (Councillor)	Not applicable	<p>Interest on an item on the Council Meeting Agenda relating to Lifegate – Item C3: Citizen of the Year Nominations</p> <p><i>Cr Bolam advised that he had served on the board with one of the candidates.</i></p>	Interest	Councillor Briefing dated 12 November 2018	No, remained in the room during discussions	A4011326 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form)
Monday 3 December 2018 (disclosure made during Councillor Briefing)	Michael O'Reilly (Mayor)	Not applicable	<p>Item listed on the Councillor Briefing Agenda relating to Council Agenda Review: C.4: Appointment of MAV Board Member</p> <p>Mayor O'Reilly advised that his brother is a candidate</p>	Indirect interest by close association	Councillor Briefing dated 3 December 2018	Yes, the Mayor left the room during discussions	A3766511 (Record of Assembly of Councillor Form)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 10 December 2018 (disclosure made during the Council Meeting)	Michael O'Reilly (Mayor)	Not applicable	C.4: Appointment of MAV Board Member  Mayor O'Reilly advised that his brother is a candidate	Indirect Interest by close association	Council Meeting 2018/OM15 – 10 December 2018	Yes, Mayor O'Reilly left the chamber during the discussions and voting	A3777024 (Minutes)
Monday 21 January 2019 (declared during Councillor Briefing)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)	Not applicable	Item C9: Request to fund a Councillor's Legal Fees on the Draft Council Meeting Agenda for 2019/OM1 – 29 January 2019  *Note this was subsequently withdrawn from the Council Meeting Agenda	Direct interest	Councillor Briefing held on 21 January 2019 – Review of Draft Council Meeting Agenda discussion	Yes, Cr Hampton left the Chamber at 8.35pm while Item C9: Request to fund a Councillor's Legal Fees was discussed and returned to the Chamber at 8.45pm	A3790730 (Record of Assembly of Councillors Form dated 21 January 2019)
Tuesday 29 January 2019 (disclosure made in writing to the CEO)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)		Declaration of interest made in writing to the Chief Executive Officer classifying the type of interest and nature of the interest in accordance s79 of the <i>Local Government Act</i> 1989.	Indirect financial interest	Council Meeting 2019/OM1 – 29 January 2019	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber during discussion and voting	A3807217 (Minutes)  A3834388 (email from Cr Cunial to CEO)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Monday 18 February 2019 (disclosure made in writing to the CEO)	Brian Cunial (Councillor)		Declaration of interest made in writing to the Chief Executive Officer classifying the type of interest and nature of the interest in accordance s79 of the <i>Local Government Act</i> 1989.	Indirect financial interest	Council Meeting 2019/OM2 – 18 February 2019	Yes, Cr Cunial left the chamber during discussion and voting	A3943347 (Minutes)  A3834388 (email from Cr Cunial to CEO)
Tuesday 12 March 2019 (disclosure made during Council Meeting) and Monday 4 March 2019 (disclosed during Councillor Briefing)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)		Item C2: Golf Course Management Tender – Probity Report	Direct interest	Council Meeting 2019/OM3 – 12 March 2019  &  Councillor Briefing dated 4 March 2019	Yes, Cr Hampton left the chamber during discussion and voting  Yes, Cr Hampton left the chamber during discussion at the Councillor Briefing session	A3943302 (Minutes)  A3843813 (Record of Assembly of Councillors form dated 4 March 2019)
Monday 1 April 2019 (disclosure made during Council Meeting and at the Councillor Briefing on 25 March 2019)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)		Item C1: Outcomes of the Audit and Risk Management Committee  Cr Hampton advised that this report contains details on the Golf Course Management Tender – Probity Report  This was also declared during the Councillor Briefing session on 25 March 2019 when the Draft Agenda was tabled for discussion	Direct interest	Council Meeting 2019/OM4 – 1 April 2019  Councillor Briefing Session - 25 March 2019	Yes, Cr Hampton left the chamber during the discussion and voting  Yes Cr Hampton left the chamber during discussion and voting at the draft Agenda review discussion on 25 March 2019.	A3943024 (Minutes)  A3887803 (Record of Assembly of Councillors form dated 25 March 2019)

Date and Time of Declaration	Name (including Position / Title)	Department and Directorate (if applicable)	Nature of Interest	Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.	Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)	After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?	EDMS ID:
Tuesday 23 April 2019 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Steve Toms (Councillor)		Item C4: Design Advisory Committee – Recommended Appointments  Cr Toms advised that he knows one of the applicants	Indirect interest	Council Meeting 2019/OM5 – 23 April 2019	No, remained in the Chamber during discussion and voting	A3955835 (Minutes)
Monday 11 November 2019 (disclosure made during Councillor Briefing)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)		Item C4: Local Government Inspectorate Investigation Outcome	Indirect Interest	Agenda Review for Ordinary Council Meeting 18 November 2019	Yes, Cr Hampton left the Assembly at 8.34pm and returned to the meeting at 8.40pm	A4090824 (Record of Assembly of Councillors)
Monday 18 November 2019 (disclosure made during pre-Agenda discussion)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)		Item C4: Local Government Inspectorate Investigation Outcome	Indirect Interest	Agenda Review for Ordinary Council Meeting 18 November 2019	Yes, Cr Hampton left the Assembly at 6.50pm while discussions took place.	A4096805 (Record of Assembly of Councillors)
Monday 18 November 2019 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)		Item C4: Monday 18 November 2019 (disclosure made during pre-Agenda discussion)	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting 2019/OM14 – 18 November 2019	Yes, Cr Hampton left the chamber during the discussion and voting	Minutes available on Council website

<b>Date and Time of Declaration</b>	<b>Name (including Position / Title)</b>	<b>Department and Directorate (if applicable)</b>	<b>Nature of Interest</b>	<b>Type of Interest i.e. Direct, Indirect etc.</b>	<b>Details (i.e. Council Meeting, Councillor Briefing, Council Report etc.)</b>	<b>After declaration, did the person remain in the room while discussions took place?</b>	<b>EDMS ID:</b>
Monday 16 December 2019 (disclosure made during pre-Agenda discussion)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)		Item 14.1: 2019/NOM56 – Notice of Rescission – Item C.4: Local Government Inspectorate Investigation Outcome	Indirect Interest	Agenda Review for Ordinary Council Meeting 16 December 2019	Yes, Cr Hampton left the Assembly at 6.37pm while discussions took place and returned at 6.38pm.	A4118532 (Record of Assembly of Councillors)
Monday 16 December 2019 (disclosure made during Council Meeting)	Colin Hampton (Councillor)		Item 14.1: 2019/NOM56 – Notice of Rescission – Item C.4: Local Government Inspectorate Investigation Outcome	Indirect Interest	Council Meeting 2019/OM15 – 16 December 2019	Yes, Cr Hampton left the chamber during the discussion and voting	Minutes available on Council website